REPUBLIC OF KENYA
NAIROBI CITY COUNTY ASSEMBLY
THIRD ASSEMBLY - (THIRD SESSION)

ORDERS OF THE DAY

TUESDAY, OCTOBER 1, 2024 AT 2.30 P.M.

ORDER OF BUSINESS

PRAYERS

1. Administration of Oath
2. Communication from the Chair
3. Messages
4. Petitions
5. Papers

6. Notices of Motion
7.
8.

Statements

*PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT, pursuant to Standing Order 203(1), this Assembly approves the
appointment of the following Members to the Select Committee on Public Accounts: -
1. Hon. Chege Mwaura, MCA
Hon. Abel Osumba Atito, MCA
Hon. Benter Juma Obiero, MCA
Hon. Redson Onyango, MCA
Hon. John Rex Omolleh, MCA
Hon. Stazo Omung’ala Ang’ila, MCA
Hon. Richardo Nyantika Billy, MCA
Hon. John Ndile Musila, MCA
9. Hon. Cyrus Mugo Mubea, MCA
10.Hon. Jane Musangi Muthembwa, MCA
11. Hon. Emmy Khatemeshi Isalambo, MCA
12. Hon. Fuad Hussein Mohamed, MCA
13.Hon. Fatuma Abduwahid Abey, MCA
14. Hon. Eutychus Mukiri Muriuki, MCA

PN ON

.../8*%Cont.



(No. 057) TUESDAY, OCTOBER 1, 2024 (201)

15.Hon. Fredrick Njoroge Njogu, MCA
16.Hon. Rachel Wanjiru Maina, MCA
17.Hon. Aaron Kangara Wangare, MCA
18. Hon. Carrington Gichunji Heho, MCA
19.Hon. Mark Thiga Ruyi, MCA

20.Hon. Simon Maina Mugo, MCA
21.Hon. Paul Wachira Kariuki, MCA
22.Hon. Martin Mbugua Mwangi, MCA
23. Hon. Mary Wanjiru Kartuki, MCA

9. * PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT pursuant to Standing Order 204(1), this Assembly approves the
appointment of the following Members to the Select Committee on Public Investments:

1. Hon. Hashim Kamau, MCA
2. Hon. Dan Oria, MCA

3.  Hon. Robert Alai, MCA

4. Hon. Thuo Fiunifu, MCA

5. Hon. Anthony Kimemia, MCA
6.  Hon. Stephen Ndegwa, MCA

7. Hon. Evans Nyangicha, MCA

8.  Hon. Peter Imwatok, MCA

9.  Hon. Malyun Abdi, MCA

10. Hon. Hellen Awour, MCA

11.  Hon. Antony Maragu, MCA

12.  Hon. Jared Akama Ondieki, MCA
13.  Hon. Patrick Karani, MCA

14.  Hon. David Magoba, MCA

15.  Hon. Tricer Jeptoo Ayabei, MCA
16.  Hon. Eric Kiogora, MCA

17.  Hon Peter Maina Mwangi, MCA
18. Hon. Jeremiah Themendu, MCA
19.  Hon. Brian Itenya, MCA

20. Hon Deonysias Mwangi, MCA
21. Hon Clement Ng’ang’a, MCA
22.  Hon Virginia Waitherero, MCA
23.  Hon Grace Kahetiy MCA

10. *PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT pursuant to Standing Order 206(1), this Assembly approves the
appointment of the following Members to the Select Committee on County Finance,

Budget and Appropriations: - ..../10*Cont.



Hon. Wilfred Oluoch Odalo, MCA
Hon. Emily Oduor, MCA

Hon. Jeckoniah Onyango, MCA
Hon. Catherine Apiyo Okoth, MCA
Hon. Moses Ogeto, MCA

Hon. Jane Muasya, MCA

Hon. Asli Muhamed, MCA

Hon. Rosemary Masitsa, MCA

9. Hon. Perpetua Mponjiwa, MCA
10.Hon. Collins Ogenga, MCA

11.Hon. Fathiya Abdillahi Mohamed, MCA
12.Hon. Sam Kago, MCA

13.Hon. Anthony Ngaruiya Jasho, MCA
14. Hon Paul Ndungu, MCA

15.Hon Ciciliah Wairimu Njathi, MCA
16.Hon Waruguru Kanyi, MCA

17.Hon Joyce Kamau Muthoni, MCA
18. Hon Waithera Chege, MCA

19.Hon Anthony Kiragu, MCA

20.Hon Mark Mugambi, MCA

21.Hon Susan Makungu, MCA

22.Hon. Jane Wanjiru, MCA

23.Hon. Peter Owera, MCA

SR A ol e

11. *)PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT, pursuant to Standing Order 207(1), this Assembly approves the

appointment of the following Members to the Select Committee on Implementation: -
1. Hon. Geoffrey Majiwa, MCA

2. Hon. Peter Imwatok, MCA
Hon. Robert Mbatia, MCA
Hon. Brian Itenya, MCA
Hon. Kennedy Swaka, MCA
Hon. Abass Khalif, MCA
Hon. Kennedy Oyugi, MCA
Hon. Nicholas Juma, MCA
Hon. Hamisi Maleya, MCA
lO Hon. Joel Munuve, MCA
11.Hon. Alvin Palapala, MCA
12.Hon. Jane Wanjiru, MCA
13.Hon. Musango Maithya, MCA

A R A Ll

.../11*Cont.



(No. 057) TUESDAY, OCTOBER 1, 2024 (203)
14. Hon. Allan Maina, MCA
15.Hon. James Kariuki, MCA
16.Hon. Paul Mathu, MCA
17. Hon. Patrick Mwangi, MCA
18.Hon. Joy Muthoni, MCA
19.Hon. Nancy Mwaura, MCA
20.Hon. Rachel Maina, MCA
21.Hon. Peter Wahinya, MCA
22.Hon. Francis Kimondo, MCA
23.Hon. Aaron Kangara, MCA

12. *PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT, pursuant to Standing Order 208, this Assembly approves the
appointment of the following Members to the Select Committee on Delegated County
Legislation: -

1. Hon. Nasra Nanda, MCA
Hon. Martin Wairobi, MCA
Hon. Farhiya Aden, MCA
Hon. Joyce Lugonzo, MCA
Hon. Lawrence Odhiambo, MCA
Hon. Dan Oria, MCA
Hon. Naomi Kerubo, MCA
Hon. Ami Perez, MCA
9. Hon. Clarence Munga, MCA
10. Hon. Victor Omondi, MCA
11.Hon. Agnes Wambui, MCA
12.Hon. Stephen Ndegwa, MCA
13. Hon. Moses Kitema, MCA
14.Hon. Emmy Khatemeshi, MCA
15. Hon. Chris Mtumishi, MCA
16.Hon. Davidson DNG, MCA
17.Hon. Lydia Akoth, MCA
18. Hon. Beatrice Wandai, MCA
19.Hon. Grace Kaheti, MCA
20. Hon. Mwaniki Kwenya, MCA
21.Hon. Cicilia Wairimu, MCA
22.Hon. Kimani Mugo, MCA
23.Hon. Virginia Kang’ethe, MCA

S A

13.*PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT, pursuant to Standing Order 209, this Assembly approves the
appointment of the following Members to various Sectoral Committees: -

.../13*Cont.



A. Sectoral Committee on Roads, Transport and Public Works
1. Hon. Musango Maithya, MCA - Chairperson

Hon. Lawrence Otieno Odhiambo, MCA - Vice-Chairperson

Hon. Shadrack Machanje Namuyu, MCA

Hon. Paul Muiruri Kiguathi Kados, MCA

Hon. Nicholas Juma Okwacho, MCA

Hon. David Magoba Odhiambo, MCA

Hon. Rosemary Masitsa Shitote, MCA

Hon. Maurice Ochieng Onyango, MCA

. Hon. Stephen Ndegwa Gitau, MCA

10. Hon. Absalom Odhiambo Onyango, MCA

11.Hon. Kennedy Swaka, MCA

12.Hon. John Ndile Musila, MCA

13.Hon. Scolastica Muthoni Mande, MCA

14. Hon. Mark Mugambi Macharia Kevin, MCA

15.Hon. Sam Kanyi Kago, MCA

16. Hon. John Mwaniki Kwenya, MCA

17.Hon. Paul Mathu Njambi, MCA

18. Hon. Aaron Kangara Wangare, MCA

19.Hon. Chris Mtumishi, MCA

20.Hon. Carrington Heho, MCA

21.Hon. Sospeter Gathahu Mumbi, MCA

22.Hon. Fredrick Njoroge Njogu, MCA

23.Hon. James Kariuki, MCA

e A Al

Sectoral Committee on Trade, Tourism & Cooperatives
. Hon. Paul Ndungu, MCA

B.

1

2. Hon. Jeckoniah Onyango, MCA
3. Hon. Abel Osumba Atito, MCA

4. Hon. David Magoba, MCA
5
6
7
8
9

. Hon. Stazo Omung’ala, MCA
. Hon. Absalom Odhiambo, MCA
. Hon. Shadrack Machanje, MCA
. Hon. Jane Wanjiru, MCA
. Hon. Peter Owera, MCA
10 Hon. Joel Munuve, MCA
11 Hon. Silas Matara Ongwae, MCA
12 Hon. John Rex Omolleh, MCA
13 Hon. Victor Omondi Ochola, MCA

..../13*Cont.



14

15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.
22.
23.

C.

D. Sectoral Committee on Agriculture, Livestock and Fisheries
Hon. Anthony Ngaruiya Jasho, MCA

Hon. Mwaniki Kwenya, MCA

Hon. Gerald Irungu, MCA

Hon. Moses Kitema, MCA

Hon. Mark Ruiyi Thiga, MCA

Hon. James Karis, MCA

Hon. Ciciliah Wairimu Njathi, MCA
Hon James Koria, MCA

Hon Lydia Okoth, MCA

Deonysias Waithira

Hon Hashim Kamau, MCA

Sectoral Committee on Labour and Social Welfare

Hon. Allan Maina, MCA
Hon. Patrick Karani, MCA
Hon. Joyce Kamau, MCA
Hon. Catherine Apiyo, MCA
Hon. Jane Muasya, MCA

Hon. Nancy Mwaura, MCA
Hon. Oscar Lore, MCA

Hon. Anthony Kimemia,MCA
9. Hon. Kennedy Odhiambo, MCA
10. Hon. Absalom Odhiambo, MCA
11.Hon. Joyce Lugonzo, MCA
12. Hon. Abass Khalif, MCA
13.Hon. Benter Obiero, MCA
14.Hon. Paul Mathu, MCA
15.Hon.Jane Musangi, MCA
16.Hon. Evans Nyangicha, MCA
17.Hon.Peter Maina, MCA
18.Hon. Paul Wachira, MCA
19.Hon. Simon Maina, MCA
20.Hon. Cicilia Njathi, MCA
21.Hon. Agnes Njeri, MCA
22.Hon. Farhiya Aden, MCA
23.Hon. Wanjiru Kariuki, MCA

S A i M

Hon. Emmy Khatemeshi, MCA
Hon. Peter Imwatok, MCA

Hon. Anthony Kiragu, MCA
Hon. Gerald Irungu, MCA

Hon. Peter Wahinya, MCA

Hon. Hashim Kamau, MCA

Ny AL

.../13*Cont.



8. Hon. Malyun Abdi, MCA

9. Hon. Scolastica Muthoni, MCA
10.Hon. Joel Munuve, MCA
11.Hon. Samson Ochieng Jera, MCA
12.Hon. Joyce Lugonzo, MCA
13.Hon. Eutychus Mukiri, MCA

14. Hon. Robert Alai, MCA

15.Hon. Naomi Kerubo, MCA
16.Hon. Emily Oduor, MCA
17.Hon. John Rex Omolleh, MCA
18.Hon. Martin Mbugua Mwangi, MCA
19. Hon. Chris Mtumishis, MCA
20.Hon. Martin Wairobi, MCA
21.Hon. Mark Thiga, MCA

22.Hon. Beatrice Wandai, MCA
23.Hon. Robert Mbatia, MCA

E. Sectoral Committee on ICT and Energy

A N

9

10.
11.
12.
13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.
22.
23.

The Hon. Fredrick Njogu, MCA
The Hon. Robert Alai, MCA

The Hon. Abbas Khalif, MCA

The Hon. Malyun Abdi, MCA

The Hon. Anthony Kimemia, MCA
The Hon. Diana Katile, MCA

The Hon. Musango Maithya, MCA
The Hon. Roseemary Masitsa, MCA
The Hon. Dabar Ahmed Qadar, MCA
The Hon. Stephen Ndegwa, MCA
The Hon. Oscar Lore, MCA

The Hon. Ami Perez, MCA

The Hon. Shadrack Machanje, MCA
The Hon. Hamisi Maleya, MCA
The Hon. Jane Wanjiru, MCA

The Hon. Grace Muigai, MCA

The Hon. Brian Itenya, MCA

The Hon. Kame Adano, MCA

The Hon. Jeremiah Themendu, MCA
The Hon. Mark Thiga, MCA

The Hon. Simon Mugo, MCA

The Beatrice Wandai, MCA

The Hon Rachel Maina, MCA

F. Sectoral Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs

1.

Hon. Jared Akama Ondieki, MCA

2. Hon. Suleiman Hamisi Maleya, MCA

..../13*Cont.



Hon. Waruguru Kanyi, MCA

Hon. Fathiya Abdilahi Mohamed, MCA
Hon. Peter Owera Oluoch, MCA
Hon. Maurice Ochieng, MCA
Hon. Perpetua Mponjiwa, MCA
Hon. Hellen Awuor, MCA

9. Hon. Ami Perez Ambala, MCA
10.Hon. Silas Matara Ong’wae, MCA
11.Hon. Agnes Wambui, MCA
12.Hon. Asli Mohamed, MCA
13.Hon. Emmy Khatemeshi, MCA
14.Hon. Clarence Munga, MCA
15.Hon. Mwaura Samora, MCA
16.Hon. Diana Katile Mwangagi, MCA
17. Hon. Virginia Kang’ethe, MCA
18.Hon. Clement Ng’ang’a, MCA
19.Hon. Deonysias Mwangi, MCA
20.Hon. Joseph Ndung’u, MCA
21.Hon. Francis Kimondo, MCA
22.Hon. Doreen Mugambi, MCA
23.Hon. Stephen Kimani Mugo, MCA

e R

. Sectoral Committee on Children, Early Childhood Education & Vocational

Training
1. The Hon. Perpetua Mponjiwa, MCA

The Hon. Kennedy Swaka, MCA

The Hon. Waithera Chege, MCA

The Hon. Robert Mbatia, MCA

The Hon. Fredrick Njoroge Njogu, MCA
The Hon. Geffrey Majiwa, MCA

The Hon. Evans Nyangicha MCA

The Hon. Mauirce Ochieng Onyango, MCA
. The Hon. Lily Akoth Kidenda, MCA

10. The Hon. Abel Osumba Atito, MCA
11.The Hon. Agnes Wambui Njeri, MCA

12. The Hon. Naomi Kerubo Bosire, MCA
13.The Hon. Absalom Odhiambo Onyango, MCA
14. The Hon. Hellen Awuor Okello, MCA

15. The Hon. Hannah Wanjiru Muriuki, MCA
16. The Hon. Eric Kiogora Murigu, MCA
17.The Hon. Rachel Wanjiru Maina

18.The Hon. Diana Katile Mwangangi, MCA

R R I NS

..../13*Cont.



H. Sectoral Committee on Environment & Natural Resources

19.The Hon. James Karanja Karis Kariuki, MCA
20.The Hon. Carrington Gichunji Heho, MCA
21.The Hon Gerald Mukuru Irungu, MCA

22.The Hon Tricer Jeptoo Ayabei, MCA

23.The Hon. Eutychus Mukiri Muriuki, MCA

1.

S A il

9.

Hon. Silas Matara Ongwae, MCA
Hon. Cyrus Mugo, MCA

Hon. Paul Kados, MCA

Hon. Catherine Apiyo Okoth, MCA
Hon. Nyantika Ricardo, MCA

Hon. Fatuma Abduwahid Abey, MCA
Hon. Nasra Nanda, MCA

Hon. Fuad Hussein, MCA

Hon. Dan Oria, MCA

10. Hon. Peter Imwatok, MCA
11.Hon. Joel Munuve, MCA

12.Hon. Agnes Wambui, MCA

13. Hon. Susan Makungu, MCA
14.Hon. Allan Maina, MCA

15. Hon. Simon Mugo Maina, MCA
16.Hon. Joseph Ndungu Karanja, MCA
17.Hon. Agnes Njeri, MCA

18. Hon. Jeremiah Themendu, MCA
19.Hon. Joy Muthoni Mwangi, MCA
20.Hon. Farhiya Aden, MCA

21.Hon. Brian Itenya, MCA

22.Hon. Joyce Muthoni Kamau, MCA
23.Hon. Fiu ni Fiu, MCA

I. Sectoral Committee on Health Services

1. Hon. Maurice Ochieng, MCA
Hon. Lily Akoth Kidenda, MCA
Hon. Chege Mwaura, MCA

Hon. Emily Oduor, MCA

Hon. Doreen Mugambi, MCA
Hon. Davidson Ngibuini, MCA
Hon. Evans Nyangicha, MCA
Hon. Benter Obiero, MCA

Hon. Ami Perez, MCA

10 Hon. Dabar Ahmedqadar, MCA

e A O &

.../13*Cont.



(No. 057) TUESDAY, OCTOBER 1, 2024 (209)
11.Hon. Redson Onyango, MCA
12.Hon. Hellen Awuor, MCA
13.Hon. Antony Maragu, MCA
14.Hon. Fatuma Abdiwahid Abey, MCA
15.Hon. Naomi Kerubo Bosire, MCA
16.Hon. Grace Kaheti, MCA
17.Hon. Stephen Mugo Kimani, MCA
18. Hon. Chris Mtumishi, MCA
19. Hon. Patrick Macharia, MCA
20.Hon. Martin Mbugua, MCA
21.Hon. Lidya Akoth, MCA
22.Hon. Kame Adano, MCA
23.Hon. Patrick Karani, MCA

14. *PROCEDURAL MOTION - THE LEADER OF MAJORITY PARTY

THAT, pursuant to the provisions Section 35 of the Nairobi City County Ward
Development Fund Act, 2014, this Assembly approves the appointment of the
following Members to the Select Committee on Ward Development Fund: -

1) The Hon. Dabar Ahmedqadar, MCA
2) The Hon. Mwaura Samora, MCA

3) The Hon. Oscar Lore, MCA

4) The Hon. Silas Matara, MCA

5) The Hon. Scolastica Muthoni, MCA

6) The Hon. James Koria, MCA

7) The Hon. Gerald Irungu, MCA

8) The Hon. Joseph Ndungu Karanja, MCA
9) The Hon. Sospeter Mumbi, MCA

10) The Hon. John Musila, MCA

11) The Hon. Hamisi Maleya, MCA

15.*COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE COUNTY ASSEMBLY - TO
CONSIDER THE NAIROBI CITY COUNTY FOOD SAFETY AND

FORTIFICATION BILL, 2023 (ASSEMBLY BILL NO.10 OF 2023)

The Nairobi City County Food Safety and Fortification Bill, 2023 (Assembly Bill No.10

of 2023)
(Hon. Elijah Stazo Omung’ala, MCA)

(Committee of the Whole County Assembly)

..../Notices



NOTICES

I. NOTICE is given that the Chairperson of the Sectorial Committee on Health
Services intends to move the following amendments to the Nairobi City
County Food Safety and Fortification Bill 2023, at the Committee Stage: -

LONG TITLE
THAT, the Long Title of the Bill be amended by deleting the
numerical “2023” and substituting thereof with “2024”.

SHORT TITLE
THAT, the Short Title of the Bill be amended by deleting the numerical
“2023” and substituting thereof with “2024”.

CLAUSE 2

THAT, Clause 2 of the Bill be amended as follows; -

(i) In the definition of the term ‘authorized officer’ by inserting the words
“public health” immediately after the words “chief officer”

(ii) By inserting a new definition as follows:

“Authority means ‘A public body having administrative powers on public

health matters™

(i) By deleting the definition of the word “Director” and replacing it thereof
with the new definitions as follows:

“Director means ‘the director Public Health

CLAUSE 3

THAT, Clause 3 of the Bill be amended by inserting a new paragraph
immediately after paragraph (e) as follows: -
(fA) Enhance public awareness on food safety and fortification’

CLAUSE 5
THAT, Clause 5 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In Sub-clause (4) by deleting the word ‘county cabinet’ and replacing it
thereof with the word “County Executive Committee’
(if) In Sub-clause (6) by inserting the word ‘public’ immediately after the word
‘officer’

CLAUSE 6
THAT, Clause 6 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In the heading by inserting the word ‘public’ immediately after the word
‘director’

..../Notices



(i) In sub-clause (1) by inserting the word ‘public’ immediately after the word
‘director’

(iii) In sub-clause (1) paragraph (b) by deleting the words ‘and fortification’

(iv)In sub-clause 1 paragraph (c) by deleting it in its entirety.

(v) In sub-clause 3 by deleting the word ‘a reasonable time’ and replacing it
thereof with the words ‘seven days’

(vi) In sub-clause 4 paragraph (c) by deleting the word ‘is willing to’ and
replacing it thereof with the word ‘may’

CLAUSE 7
THAT, Clause 7 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In sub-clause (1) paragraph (f) by deleting the word ‘educate and inform and
replacing it thereof with the word ‘sensitize’

CLAUSE 8
THAT, Clause 8 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In sub-clause 1 by deleting it in its entirety and replacing it thereof with a
new sub-clause 1 as follows:
(1) There is established a Committee to be known as the Nairobi City County
Multi-sectoral Committee on Food Safety and Fortification”

(if) In sub-clause 2 by deleting the words ‘composed of” and replacing it thereof

with the words “unincorporated and shall be comprised of”

(i) In sub-clause 2 by inserting a new paragraph (j) immediately after paragraph
(i) as follows:

“(@iA) a representative from the Kenya Bureau of Standards”

(iv)By adding a new sub-clause 3 immediately after sub-clause 2 paragraph (i) as
follows:
“2A) The functions of the Committee shall be to: -

a) formulate relevant County food safety and fortification policies;

b) implement food safety and fortification policies and regulations including
but not limited to regulations on food testing and analysis, surveillance,
inspection and enforcement;

c) Develop and utilize a transparent decision-making processes based on
scientific evidence on issues related to food safety and fortification;

d) Advise the Executive Committee Member Health on matters food safety
and fortification within the County.

..../Notices



e) Promote food safety and fortification among stakeholders such as
producers and retailers;

f) Provide a platform for consumer sensitization on food safety and
fortification; and

@) Promote participatory capacity building for an effective County Food
Safety System.

h) Any other relevant and lawful function necessary for implementation of

this Act.

CLAUSE 19

THAT, Clause 19 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In sub-clause (2) paragraph (i)

a) by deleting the numerical “50,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “Fifty Thousand”

b) by deleting the numerical “1000,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “Two Hundred Thousand”

c) by deleting the numerical “2000,000” and replacing it thereof with the
words “Five Hundred Thousand”

d) by deleting the numerical ‘12’ and replacing it with the word “six”

(if) In sub-clause (2) paragraph (ii)

a) By deleting the numerical “100,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “One Hundred Thousand”

b) by deleting the numerical “2000,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “Five Hundred Thousand”

c) by deleting the numerical “4000,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “One Million”

d) by deleting the numerical 24’ and substituting thereof with the word

“Twelve”

CLAUSE 20
THAT, Clause 20 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) By deleting it in its entirety

CLAUSE 21
THAT, Clause 21 of the Bill be amended by deleting it in its entirety

CLAUSE 24
THAT, Clause 24 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In sub-clause (1) paragraph (c)
a) by deleting it in its entirety and replacing it with a new paragraph (c) as
tollows:
..../Notices



“(c) Where it is the professional opinion of the authorized officer that any food
article(s) is unfit for human consumption and can be treated, order it to be
treated.

b) By inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (c) as follows;
(ca) Where it is the professional opinion of the authorized officer that any food
article(s) is unfit for human consumption and cannot be treated, refer the matter
to court for an order of destruction or deposition.

(i) In sub-clause (2)

a) By inserting the words “the goods” immediately before the word ‘are”

b) By adding a new paragraph (c) immediately after paragraph (b)as follows:-
“the authorized officer has obtained a court order for destruction”

CLAUSE 26

THAT, Clause 26 of the Bill be amended as follows; -

(i) In sub-clause (2) paragraph (a)

a) By deleting the numerical “200,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “Fifty Thousand”

(if) In sub-clause (2) paragraph (b)

a) By deleting the numerical “500,000” and substituting thereof with the
words “Two Hundred Thousand”

CLAUSE 27
THAT, Clause 27 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) In the heading by inserting the word “General” immediately before the word
“Penalties”
(i) In paragraph (i)
a) By deleting the words “five hundred” and substituting thereof with the
word “fifty”
b) By deleting the words “one year” and substituting thereof with the words
“three months”
(iii) In paragraph (ii)
a) By deleting the words “one million” and substituting thereof with the
words “One Hundred Thousand”
b) By deleting the words “two years” and substituting thereof with the

words “six months”

CLAUSE 28
THAT, Clause 28 of the Bill be amended by deleting it in its entirety

CLAUSE 33

THAT, Clause 33 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
..../Notices



(i) By inserting in brackets the numerical “(1)” immediately after the
numerical “33”

(i) By inserting sub-clause (2) immediately after the word “care” as follows;

“(2) An authorized officer who —

a) directly or indirectly solicits for or receives in connection with their duties
any payment or other reward whatsoever, whether pecuniary or otherwise
or a promise or security as a bribe or

b) enters into any agreement to do, abstain from doing, permit, conceal or
connive in any act which is contrary to the provisions of this Act or the
proper execution of their duties or

c) Uses their position to unlawfully enrich themselves or others; shall be
guilty of an offence and liable to imprisonment for a term not exceeding

five years or to a fine not exceeding one million shillings or both.

CLAUSE 35
THAT, Clause 35 of the Bill be amended as follows; -
(i) By inserting the words “the Standards Act (Cap 496)” immediately after
the word “(Cap.254)”

..../Notices



NOTICES

II. The Assembly resolved on Wednesday, 14™ February, 2024 as follows: -

a) THAT, cach speech in a debate on any Motion, including a Special
motion be limited in the following manner:-A maximum of three hours with
not more than twenty (20) minutes for the Mover and ten (10) minutes for each
other Member speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader
of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen (15) minutes
each, and that ten (10) minutes before the expiry of the time, the Mover shall
be called upon to reply; and that priority in speaking be accorded to the Leader
of the Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of

the relevant Sectoral Committee, in that Order.

b) THAT, cach speech in a debate on Bills NOT sponsored by a
Committee, the Leader of the Majority Party or the Leader of the Minority Party
be limited as follows:- A maximum of three hours and thirty minutes, with not
more than thirty (30) minutes for the Mover, in moving and ten (10) minutes in
replying, a maximum of thirty (30) minutes for the Chairperson of the relevant
Committee and a maximum of ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking,
except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party,
who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen Minutes (15) each; and that priority
in speaking be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader of the
Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Sectoral Committee, in that
Order.

* Denotes Orders of the Day*




